
Promise To Kill: A Thrilling Clyde Barr
Adventure You Don't Want To Miss!

Are you a fan of action-packed thrillers? Do you crave gripping stories that
keep you on the edge of your seat? Then buckle up, because Clyde Barr is
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back in "Promise To Kill" - the latest novel in the heart-stopping Clyde Barr
series written by bestselling author Erik Storey!

Meet Clyde Barr: The Unstoppable Protagonist

Clyde Barr, the rugged and resilient protagonist, returns in "Promise To Kill"
to face yet another perilous adventure. A former military operative turned
vigilante, Barr is no stranger to danger. With a strong moral compass and
an unwavering determination to fight for justice, Barr's character has
captivated readers around the world.
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Storey's ability to craft a flawed yet relatable lead character has earned him
a loyal fanbase. Barr's traumas and internal struggles make him a multi-
dimensional hero, a man on a personal mission to right the wrongs he has
witnessed and experienced.

The Plot: Danger Lurking at Every Turn

In "Promise To Kill," Barr finds himself in a desperate hunt for a missing
child. What starts as a simple mission quickly spirals into a race against
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time as he uncovers a heinous plot that threatens innocent lives.

Storey's intricate storytelling weaves together elements of suspense,
betrayal, and heart-stopping action. As Barr digs deeper into the dark
underbelly of the conspiracy, he must confront his own demons while
evading deadly assassins and corrupt officials.

The plot is as gripping as ever, keeping readers hooked from the first page
to the last. With unexpected twists and intense moments, "Promise To Kill"
delivers an adrenaline-pumping story that will leave readers breathless.

Erik Storey: A Master of Thrills

Erik Storey's talent for crafting thrilling narratives shines through in
"Promise To Kill." With each installment, Storey has consistently delivered
high-octane adventures that keep readers begging for more.

His descriptive prose transports readers to the rugged wilderness, making
them feel the bone-chilling cold or the adrenaline rush of high-speed
chases. Storey's attention to detail paints vivid pictures in the mind of
readers, immersing them in the world of Clyde Barr.

Why "Promise To Kill" Should Be On Your Reading List

Not only does "Promise To Kill" continue the pulse-pounding legacy of
Clyde Barr, but it also delves deeper into his complex character and
introduces new depths to his past. Storey's ability to create engaging
narratives combined with his knack for writing compelling dialogue make
this novel a must-read for any action thriller enthusiast.



As you follow Barr on his mission to save the missing child and unravel the
conspiracy, you will find yourself turning pages faster than ever before. You
won't be able to put this book down once you're hooked!

For fans of action, suspense, and unforgettable characters, "Promise To
Kill" is a novel that offers it all. Erik Storey once again proves his mastery of
the genre, delivering a heart-pounding and captivating story that will have
you begging for more Clyde Barr adventures.

So go ahead, grab a copy of "Promise To Kill," sit back, and prepare to
embark on an electrifying journey alongside Clyde Barr. This is one thriller
you don't want to miss!
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Clyde Barr returns in “one of the best thrillers of the year” (The Washington
Times) that “promises intense, edge-of-the-seat excitement to anyone who
picks it up” (Nelson DeMille).
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Clyde Barr, the drifter with lethal skills, is alone again, wandering the
highways of the American West in search of something to believe in. As
summer turns to autumn, he trades his car for a horse and heads for the
mountains, planning to clear his head and regain his edge with some
hunting. But when he runs across an elderly sick man—a Ute Indian from a
nearby reservation—Clyde’s dream of solitude is quickly dashed.

On the reservation, Clyde finds the old man’s daughter, Lawana, as well as
a group of menacing bikers called the Reapers running wild in the
economically depressed, half-abandoned village. Gripped by the desire to
do good in a bleak world, Clyde offers to stay on Lawana’s ranch to help
out until her father is released from the hospital. He controls himself around
the bikers, even when he sees them harass a few Native American women
—but when the Reapers attack a local boy Clyde has to do something. As
tensions rise between the locals and the Reapers, Clyde’s efforts to protect
the reservation become a fight for his and Lawana’s lives. And then the
stakes ratchet up even more.

A Promise to Kill is the edge-of-the-seat sequel to Nothing Short of Dying
that “readers will have a hard time putting…down” (Publishers Weekly).
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